
Block Party Basket Themes by Classroom 
 

 

Please send in your items to your classroom by 4/19.  Alternatively, donations may be sent in 
addressed to “CMS PTO” or made online at cmspto.com/donate 

Classroom Basket Theme Donation Ideas 
 
K Caldwell 
K Hoadley 

 
Bake it Easy 

Culinary Kids:  
Cookie Cutters, Baking Mixes, 
Sprinkles, Decorating tools, 
Cooking tools, Cookbooks, etc. 
 

 
K McDonald 
K Nazzaro 

 
We Grow Together 

Nature and Gardening: Seeds, 
pots, gardening tools, butterfly 
hatcher, Insect collector, wind 
chime kit, Bird house kit, craft 
kits 

 
1 Hepburn 
1 Moran 
1 Noyes/ Ribaudo  
 

 
Life’s A Beach 

Beach Day/Lake Day:  Sand 
Toys, Towels, Sunscreen, 
Outdoor games, Pool toys 

 
2 L. Brown 
2 Heath 

 
Snuggle Up 

For a Cozy afternoon: 
Squishmallows and stuffies, 
blankets, pillows, hot cocoa, 
snacks, books, craft kits, 
slippers 

 
2 LaTorra 
2 Miner 
 

 
It’s All Fun and Games 

Things for A Rainy Day: 
Toys, Games, Fidgets, art 
supplies,  

 
3 M. Brown 
3 Perkins 

 
Keep it Colorful 

For Little Artists:  
Art Supplies, coloring books, 
art kits, paint, crayons, 
markers 

 
3 Carroll 
4 Lonergan 

 
Have a Ball 

For Athletes:  
sports equipment, outdoor 
games, bug spray, sunscreen, 
team wear 

 
4 Ferrier  
4 Olive 
 

 
Anything But Screentime 

Brain engaging activities: 
 books, stem kits, legos, slime, 
fidgets, mad libs, crafts 

 
5 Barnewall 
5 Pelletier 
5 Taylor 

 
Wild and Free 

For the Great Outdoors:  
Camping gear, S’mores 
supplies, compass, walkie-
talkies, lantern, flashlight, 
wildlife or hiking guides, 
binoculars, trail mix, 
canteen/water bottle  


